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Joan:  Well, welcome everyone. 
 
John:  Welcome, welcome!  It’s good to see everybody.  This zoom is really neat, just 
because you can see everybody.  And it’s nice to be seen and it’s nice to see everybody.  
That’s the really good thing. 
 
Of course, we have different hosts – you know, Joe and Kim are going to be in the 
background and listen and help us with technical stuff.  But Melainah and Joan and I 
wanted to just say a couple of things before we got started. 
 
Melainah:  Welcome, everyone.  We are all very excited about this day.  And can you 
guys believe it’s been a Journey of FIVE years, that has led us to this momentous day.  
So, we, and I think Joan, John, and all the Beings of Light are very excited and happy to 
be here. 
 
Joan:  And I am very thrilled that we have reached this pinnacle, that we are actually – 
just like when we activated our Light Body, there are levels of this Ascension process.  
So, this is our graduation from the current segment of Teachings that we have been so 
fortunate in receiving from the Teachers of Light.  So, I know everybody is excited and 
thrilled to participate in this session. 
 
John:  When I first heard about this, I couldn’t believe it, I guess.  It was something that 
it didn’t seem like it was in any kind of plan.  Well, I mean it was in the Gang’s plan, but 
not something that I thought about.  But it is certainly is auspicious and a real thrill to 
me.   
 
So, I just wanted to say that and thank everybody  for just being you.  It’s nice to see 
y’all.  And like I said before, we were a little worried, but not so much.  And I stopped 
thinking about it and we just keep doing one day at a time.  So, that’s exciting.  Just 
wanted to share that with you and say thanks. 
 
So, before we get started, we do have quite an interesting development that took place 
from the Community, but from Lee Ann Reid in particular.  She contacted us a few 
weeks ago and asked to deliver a gift to the group.  And so, because I certainly can’t 
explain, Lee Ann if you would jump on and kind of give us a little one-up as to what 
happened and how and what it’s meant to us, please. 
 
Lee Ann:  This has been a long process.  It started in 2018.  I’ve always loved Leonard 
Cohen’s song Hallelujah, especially by K.D. Lang.  But when I heard it just musically, it 
really spoke to me.  Spirit kind of said, “You need to write lyrics to this”.  And I went, 
“Yeah, OK”.  And lots of time….  And I kind of played around with it.   
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Lee Ann, cont’d:  The 2019 Conference came and wouldn’t you know it, at the end the 
same song played.  And this time, I got a definite hit from and was guided to write.  And 
it just was “Write, write, write”.  That trip we had driven down with Margaret and our 
little vintage trailer, so as I drove home I had a new purpose, new words, and a new 
Light.  And then the Great White Dragon reminded me of a promise made, a promise 
kept, and a promise fulfilled.  I had written a lot before, but I never share it.  It’s 
something that I kind of hold close to my Heart.  And when I got home, the group was 
asked to provide lyrics and I thought, “Phew, I’m kind of off the hook”.  But then, no I 
wasn’t off the hook.  And as I read the lyrics submitted by our Collective, I felt the 
Energies and how hard we had worked and how we had risen to complete each level, 
each tool, each concept, how we kept pushing through under the Guidance of the 
Ascended Masters, the Archangels, the Beings of Light, as transmitted by Joan and 
Melainah.  And together we pressed on. 
 
So, I knew that I had to get this done.  And by the end of October, I had it pretty much 
all, October of 2019, I had it pretty much all compiled, the lyrics were written.  And I 
thought, “OK, I am done”.  But I still had this niggling inside.  So I sent it off to Ann 
Crawford, and bless her Heart.  I said, “I just need you to look at this and edit.”  And she 
said, “Well, there’s really not a lot to edit.  It’s great the way it is.”  And she encouraged 
me to continue writing and go ahead and continue on. 
 
Well, the continue on was find somebody to sing it that was awake and could feel our 
Collective Energy.  And that kind of went in bits and sputters.  My former husband was a 
great singer.  And he’s awake.  We were together with Mastering Alchemy.  And I said, 
“Would you look at this, and if you feel it, would you sing it?”  And so he said, “Your 
stamp’s all over this.”  And he sang it to me all over the phone.  And it was beautiful.  
But it was what I was used to hearing.  And he never got it recorded and he passed away 
in April.   
 
So, I’m like back to square one.  And I happened to find out through a conversation that 
one of my sisters of the Heart is a singer.  And I was like, “Seriously!”  And she’s awake 
and she’s alive and she’s enlightened.  And so, many of you know her.  It’s Nadine.  And I 
sent her the lyrics and she hasn’t really sung since 2005.  And she laid down one track 
and she said, “This is a practice; I don’t think it’s for sharing with the peeps”.  And I 
went, “It’s beautiful as it stands”.  And so what you’re hearing is the first and only track 
of this song being sung.   
 
And I just wanted to thank everybody and let you know that it’s my privilege and honor 
to have compiled the thoughts and Energies of this Collective, as guided, and compose 
this – our Anthem.  I wanted to thank Joe Jett for his help and Ann and Nadine for her 
interpretation and voice.  And it will be played at the end, at the conclusion of the 
Conference.   
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Lee Ann, cont’d:  This song is for our group’s edification.  It’s for our Hearts.  And I 
would kind of prefer that it not be shared outside of this group.  And if you’d like a copy 
of the lyrics, I sent them to Melainah and Joan, and I have them as well.  And I’m happy 
to share them.   
 
Thank you all.  I couldn’t have done this without each and every one of you.   
I appreciate you all. 
 
Joan:  Thank you so much.  We really appreciate you.   
They lyrics are absolutely beautiful and perfect.   
 
The reason that we’re asking you not to share -- I don’t know about the lyrics -- but if 
you share the song, there are copyright laws as far as the music is concerned.  So, we 
don’t want to infringe on that.  So, if you will just take it as a gift to us from Lee Ann.  
And we so appreciate you, Lee Ann, for sharing your creative lyrics, because they are 
absolutely beautiful. 
 
Lee Ann:  Just one other thing.  If people feel led, Nadine and I were kind of pushing 
each other on this.  I didn’t have to pull the friend card, or the sister card.  She just said 
she’d record.  But if you feel led, if you could drop her a line and show your 
appreciation.  She really went out on a limb.  She hasn’t sung since 2005.  And she 
stepped out there for us.  And I really appreciate that.  And that’s all I have. 
 
Joan, Melainah, John:  Thank you!  Thank you!  Thanks! 
 
John:  Now, let’s just do a quick review of the events for the day. 
We’re going to start off with Archangel Gabriel.  And he’ll honor us with a centering 
meditation and then personally take us to the Sirian Star Gate. 
An Ra Ta and Un La Ta will introduce all who are in attendance. 
Lord Metatron will present us at that time with a Cosmic Edict. 
And then after that, Melainah will bring forth Mary Magdalene and Yeshua, who will 
present us with our Light Scrolls. 
 
It’s hard to just say it without being excited.  But it’s a BIG DEAL. 
And then we will end with the new Hallelujah, thanks to Lee Ann. 
 
So, that’s basically what we’re going to do the rest of the afternoon.  And so, let’s just 
start off with our good buddy, Archangel Gabriel, and see what he has to say for us and 
to us and the meditation.  And then on to the Star Gate.   
 


